
Whole Food & Raw, Wild Turmeric plus Raw CO2 Hemp Extract

Fast Acting

TURMERIC-HEMP SYNERGY

CanacurminTM

Supports a healthy inflammation and pain response

Canacurmin is the only truly wild plus raw turmeric-hemp 
extract available. The hemp extract is certified organic, and the 
turmeric extract is 100% wild. The turmeric in Canacurmin is 
highly potent, because it is made exclusively from the 
wild-growing spice thriving without farming or cultivation. 
Because it is wild, it is free of all pesticides and herbicides.

 Canacurmin is unique because of the method of processing. 
Supercritical CO2 extraction is used, which means it is rich in 
all the naturally occurring compounds found in both the hemp 
plant and turmeric root, including all the naturally occurring 
polyphenols and terpenes. It also contains turmeric essential 
oils, known as turmerones, along with terpenes, waxes, and 
sterols. The turmerones, terpenes, waxes, and sterols are lost 
in standard turmeric supplements. It also has a high density of 
turmeric polysaccharides, which have novel, health-giving 
properties for boosting immunity. Also, it is a dense source of 
phytocannabinoids, some 80 different forms, which support 
the CB2 receptor system and work in synergy with the 
turmeric compounds.

 A second extraction utilizes certified organic alcohol, 
which concentrates the pigments: the curcuminoids, including 
curcumin. Canacurmin is the only turmeric supplement 
extracted with certified organic alcohol. All others use the 
commercial grade, which may be tainted with GMOs. Since 
CO2 extraction is used, all the enzymes are intact, as are the 
highly active biological molecules, the turmerones, which 
support cellular function. Other purveyors are not so 
forthcoming about their extraction processes. Thus, with 
Canacurmin, there is full and complete transparency.

 It is also unique because it contains synergizing spice oils, 
wild oils of oregano and rosemary, which dramatically 
increase its potency. Organic-source ginger oleoresin is also 
added. Along with turmeric and hemp extract, all such spice 
oils support a healthy inflammatory response and also support 

the health of the nervous system. Turmeric and ginger also 
support a healthy digestive response, while hemp extract, 
through activating CB2 receptors, supports healthy intestinal, 
bone, nerve, and digestive function.

 Canacurmin is free of all GMOs and no GM substances are 
used in processing. It is also free of all chemical additives and 
excipients. Available as mycellized sublingual drops, this 
offers immediate absorption. It is also available as 500 mg 
gelcaps in an oil phase, which aids in utilization. Compare 
this to pressed pills and dried powder isolates, which suffer 
from poor absorption and utilization. Hemp extract is the 
nervous system component, while the turmeric supports the 
body’s inflammation response. That’s why Canacurmin is 
ideal.
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